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Wei Hu

From: Sandra Ramirez <sandra@expostones.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 28, 2011 12:50 PM

To: smartstone@vsnl.net

Cc: Wei Hu; John

Subject: RE: YOUR ORDERS

Aditya, 
below is the freight forwarders information and below that on is their contact in India. If you 

have any question please either contact Wei or John from General Noli 
  
Wei Hu  
weihu@newyork.generalnoli.com 
Vice President 

General Noli USA Inc.  

148-08 Guy R. Brewer Blvd.  
Jamaica, NY 11434 

Tel: 718-995-9233 
Fax: 718-995-8970 
or 
  
John Mancini 
johnm@generalnoli.com 

General Noli USA 

148-08 Guy R Brewer Blvd 
Jamaica, NY 11434 

  
Contact in India: 
CTC: Purushotham Rao  
504, 5th Floor, Surya Kiran Complex, S.D.Road, Sec – 500 003, A.P., India | Ph: +91 40 2784 
5441, 2784 5460 | Fax: +91 40 6633 9683 | Cell: +91 99896 98031 | 

Email: purushotham.hyd@sdb.in  
 
 
Have a Wonderful Day!! 
Sandra Ramirez  
Quality Control Manager 
Expo Granite Marble LLC 
P:713.984.8228 F:713.984.9816 

  
  
  

-------- Original Message -------- 

Subject: Re: YOUR ORDERS 
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From: smartstone@vsnl.net 

Date: Tue, December 27, 2011 12:24 pm 

To: said@expostones.com, sandra@expostones.com, "Factory" 

<smartstone@vsnl.net> 

 
 

Dear Mr Said, 
 
Good day to you. Hope you are doing well. 
 
Thank you so very much for your confirmation. Would be obliged if you could kindly provide us with the 
contact details of your forwarder so that we may facilitate earliest shipment. 
 
Assuring you of my best services. 
 
Thanks and regards 
For Smartstone 
 
Aditya  
Sent from BlackBerry® on Airtel 

From: said@expostones.com  
Date: Tue, 27 Dec 2011 09:52:28 -0700 
To: smartstone<smartstone@vsnl.net> 
Subject: RE: YOUR ORDERS 
 
ok 
 
Said Qartoumy 
President /CEO 
1055 W.Sam Houston Ste. 100 
Houston, TX 77055 
PH: 713-984-8228 
Fax;713.984.9816 
  
  
-------- Original Message -------- 

Subject: Re: YOUR ORDERS 

From: smartstone <smartstone@vsnl.net> 

Date: Tue, December 27, 2011 2:54 am 

To: Sandra Ramirez <sandra@expostones.com> 

Cc: said@expostones.com 
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DEAR MAAM, 
  
GOOD DAY TO YOU. HOPPE YOU ARE DOING WELL. 
  
MAAM WE THANK YOU FOR HAVING SWENT ACROSS ORDERS FOR TWO CNTRS. JUST ONE SMALL 
REQUEST..........THE GOLDEN BEACH SLABS ONLY 3 ARE NICE THE REST HAVE COME OUR WITH 
SOME CRACKS..  THE SAME ARE NOT FIT FOR EXPORTS AND WE WANT TO SEND YOU ONLY THE 
BEST. WE ARE PROCESSING MORE OF THE SAME AND WILL FORWARD MORE PICTURES TO YOU 
SHORTLY. CAN WE REQUEST YOU TO KINDLY REPLACE THE SAME WITH 4 BUNDLES OF MADURA 
GOLD @ 5.40 (YOU HAD REALLY LIKED THESES SLABS TOO) AND GIVE US THE  GO AHEAD SO THAT 
WE MAY PROCEED WITH THE SHIPMENTS. 
  
THEN THE CNTR COMPOSITION WOULD FINALLY READ AS : 
  
01. PARADISO BASH 2 CMS STD            40 SLABS            $ 4.40 
02. KASHMIR GOLD 2 CMS STD              40 SLABS            $ 4.40    
03. KASHMIR WHITE 2 CMS  1ST            40 SLABS            $ 4.40 
04. MADURA GOLD 2 CMS  1ST              40 SLABS            $ 5.40 

  
MAAM ALSO WE ARE PLEASED TO INFORM YOU THAT WE HAVE ALREADY RECEIVED THE 
CLEARANCE FROM THE CREDIT INSURANCE COMPANY AND ARE FULLY READY TO MAKE 
SHIPMENTS TO YOU.  
  
YOUR EARLIEST CONFIRMATION AND PROVIDING DETAILS OF YOUR NOMINATED FORWARDER 
WOULD ENABLE US TO FACILITATE EARLIEST SHIPMENT. 
  
HOPING YOU WILL OBLIGE. ASSURING YOU OF MY BEST SERVICES AT ALL TIMES. 
  
THANKS AND REGARDS 
FOR SMARTSTONE 

  
ADITYA  

  

----- Original Message -----  
From: Sandra Ramirez  
To: smartstone  
Sent: Monday, December 26, 2011 9:01 PM 
Subject: RE: YOUR ORDERS 
 

Dear Mr. Aditya, 

Mr. Said looked at the pictures of the material you have send us and he wanted me to give you the following order.  
  
Paradiso Bash    40 Slabs    $4.40 
Kashmir Gold     40 Slabs    $4.40 
Golden Beach    30 Slabs    $5.75 
Kashmir White   40 Slabs    $4.40 
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If you can do the Tan Brown at $3.75 then he said we can take a container of that color but only if we can get it at 
that price. Let me know if we can get these containers at this price. I'll look forward to hearing from you. 
 

Have a Wonderful Day!! 
Sandra Ramirez  
Quality Control Manager 
Expo Granite Marble LLC 
P:713.984.8228 F:713.984.9816 
  
  
  

-------- Original Message -------- 

Subject: Re: YOUR ORDERS 

From: smartstone <smartstone@vsnl.net> 

Date: Mon, December 19, 2011 2:45 am 

To: Sandra Ramirez <sandra@expostones.com> 

 

  
DEAR MR SAID, MS SANDRA, 
  
GOOD DAY TO YOU. HOPE YOU ARE DOING WELL. 
  
MAAM AS DESIRED BY YOU WE ARE FORWARDING TO YOU PICTURES OF BASH PARADISO 2 CMS IN 
READY STOCKS WITH US. WE HAVE AVAILABLE 40 SLABS OF THE SAME. 
  
RE YOUR ORDERS DURING OUR MEETING IT WAS SPECIFIED THAT THE ORDERS WULD BE THREE 
TO FOUR CNTRS COMPRISING OF BOTH FIRST CHOICE AS WELL AS STANDARD MATERIAL IN 2 CMS 
THICKNESS AT ONE GO WITH MINIMUM QUANTITY OF 3 BUNDLES OF ANY MATERIAL HENCE WE 
HAD FORWARDED OUR BEST RATES BASED ON THAT. NOW THE RATES EXPECTED BY YOU ARE 
LOWER AND THE QUANTITY IS ALSO JUST ONE CNTR WITH MAYBE A BUNDLE OF ONE COLOUR. IT 
WOULD NOT MAKE IT A VIABLE PRPOSITION FOR US SIR AS FOR SMALL QTYS OF ONLY FIRST 
CHOICE MATERIAL IS VERY DIFFICULT OT OFFER AT YOUR PRICES. I HOPE YOU WILL UNDERSTAND 
OUR POSITION. WE REQUEST YOU TO FINALISE MORE QUANTITIES ATLEAST 3 CMTRS FROM THE 
LIST OF MATERIAL AND PICTURES WE HAVE FORWARDED TO YOU AND LET US KNOW THE FIANL 
QUANTITIES OF EACH COLOUR AND YOUR EXPECTED PRICES AND WE WILL TRY AND MATCH YOUR 
PRICES OR ATLEAST COME AS CLOSE AS IS POSSIBLE SO THAT YOU MAY FINALISE THE ORDER. 
  
IN THE MEANWHILE WE HAVE ALREADY APPLIED OR NECESSARY ECGC CLEARANCE AND IT 
SHOULD BE DONE IN ABOUT SEVEN TO TEN DAYS, SO YOUR EARLIEST ACTIONS WOULD ENSURE 
THAT THE CARGO IS READY BY THE TIME WE OBTAIN THE CLEARANCE. HOPING YOU WILL OBLIGE. 
  
ASSURING YOU OF MY BEST SERVICES AT ALL TIMES. 
  
THANKS AND REGARDS 
FOR SMARTSTONE 

  
ADITYA 

----- Original Message -----  
From: Sandra Ramirez  
To: smartstone  
Sent: Thursday, December 15, 2011 10:10 PM 
Subject: RE: SUPPLY OF GRANITE SLABS FROM INDIA 
 

Aditya, 
Mr. Said has looked over the email and he wanted me to give you the prices we've paid for some of these granites 
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to see if we can get you to give us the same pricing we've had before.  
FIRST CHOICE MATERIAL IN 2 CMS THICKNESS: 
01. MADURA GOLD 2 CMS 1ST CHOICE              70 SLABS           USD 5.75    $5.45 take all 

slabs.     

03. KASHMIR WHITE 2 CMS 1ST CHOICE           40 SLABS           USD 4.75    $4.40 take all slabs. 
04. GOLDEN BEACH 2 CMS 1ST CHOICE             30 SLABS           USD 6.00    $5.60 take all slabs. 
 
  
STANDARD MATERIAL IN 2 CMS THICKNESS: 
02. KASHMIR GOLD 2 CMS STANDARD              40 SLABS           USD 4.75     $4.40 take all slabs. 
  
If you can do these prices Mr. Said said to send us ALL the Kashmir White and ALL the Golden Beach and 10 slabs 

of the Madura Gold (all 1st choice) in one container to begin with then work our way for more material. If we can 
purchase the material at our prices please let me know so that I can give you our Freight Forwarders information 
so we can get the container booked. The following is our Bank Information; 
  

Chase Bank 

546 West 19th St 

Houston, TX 77008 
Contact: Ahmad Elkhatib 
P: 713.868.8657 
F: 713.868.8677 
C: 281.793.3322 
Email: ahmad.m.elkhatib@chase.com  
  
Also if you can send us pictures of the standard material you're offering us I would really appreciate it. Thank you 

and I will wait your response.  
  
  
Have a Wonderful Day!! 
Sandra Ramirez  
Quality Control Manager 
Expo Granite Marble LLC 

P:713.984.8228 F:713.984.9816 
  
  
  

-------- Original Message -------- 

Subject: SUPPLY OF GRANITE SLABS FROM INDIA 

From: smartstone <smartstone@vsnl.net> 

Date: Thu, December 15, 2011 4:40 am 

To: Said@expostones.com 

Cc: Sandra@expostones.com 

  

DEAR MR SAID QARTOUMY, 

  

GOOD DAY TO YOU SIR. HOPE YOU ARE DOING WELL AND THAT YOU REMEBER ME. 

  

SIR FIRSTLY I THANK YOU FOR THE COURTESY EXTENDED TO ME DURING MY VISIT TO 

YOUR WAREHOUSE AND FOR GIVING US AN OPPURTUNITY OF BECOMING YOUR 

SUPPLIERS OF SLABS FROM INDIA. WE LOOK FORWARD TO DOING GOOD WORK FOR 
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YOU. 

  

ALSO AM TERRIBLY SORRY FOR THE DELAY IN COMMUNICATING WITH YOU...... I JUST 

RETURNED TO INDIA ON THE 28TH OF NOVEMBER AFTER A TEDIOUS 26 DAY TOUR OF 

THE US, ON 29TH I LEFT FOR JAIPUR FOR A FAMILY WEDDING RETURNED ONLY ON THE 

5TH, WAS DOWN WITH SEVER VIRAL FEVER FOR THREE DAYS TO FOUR DAYS........ ALL 

THE TRAVELLING DOES TAKE ITS TOLL I GUESS. FURTHER AS I WAS AWAY FROM WORK 

FOR A MONTH THINGS WERE TERRIBLE OUT HERE AT THE FACTORY.......HENCE TOOK A 

FEW DAYS TO SORT OUT CERTAIN THINGS THAT WERE PRESSING. ALSO THE FACTORY 

WAS CHOC A BLOCK WITH SLABS AND HENCE I WAS FORCED TO CHANNELISE ALL MY 

EFFORTS THERE.  HENCE THE DELAY.........SORRY FOR ANY INCONVENIENCE CAUSED. 

HOWEVER THE GOOD NEWS IS THAT I AM NOW BACK HERE AND AT YOUR DISPOSAL. 

  

WITH REGARDS TO THE COLOURS SPECIFIED BY YOU AND AS PER YOUR 

INSTURCTIONS WE ARE FORWARDING LIST OF MATERIAL AVAILABLE FOR IMMEDIATE 

DESPATCH TO YOU IN 2CMS THICKNESS ALONGWITH THEIR PICTURES AS UNDER: 

  

FIRST CHOICE MATERIAL IN 2 CMS THICKNESS: 

01. MADURA GOLD 2 CMS 1ST CHOICE              70 SLABS           USD 5.75         

02. TAN BROWN 2 CMS 1ST CHOICE                    40 SLABS           USD 4.50 

03. KASHMIR WHITE 2 CMS 1ST CHOICE           40 SLABS           USD 4.75 

04. GOLDEN BEACH 2 CMS 1ST CHOICE             30 SLABS           USD 6.00 

  

STANDARD MATERIAL IN 2 CMS THICKNESS: 

01. PARADISO BASH 2 CMS STANDARD              40 SLABS           USD 4.60 

02. KASHMIR GOLD 2 CMS STANDARD              40 SLABS           USD 4.75 

03. IVORY FANTASY 2 CMS STANDARD               60 SLABS          USD 4.60 

04. TAN BROWN 2 CMS STANDARD                      40 SLABS          USD 3.75 

05. MADURA GOLD 2 CMS STANDARD                20 SLABS          USD 4.75 

06. PREMIUM BLACK 2 CMS ( 270 X 140)              20 SLABS          USD 6.00 (DARK AND 

FIRST CHOICE BUT UNDERSIZED) 

07. KASHMIR WHITE 2 CMS STANDARD             20 SLABS          USD 4.20 

08. SHIVAKASHI 2 CMS STANDARD                      20 SLABS          USD 5.50 

  

SIR BETWEEN THE ABOVE MATERIAL WE CAN COMFORTABLY PUT TOGETHER 4 CNTRS. 

JUST LET US KNOW THE COLOURS YOU ARE INTERESTED IN SO THAT WE MAY 

FORWARD THE PICTURES OF THE SAME TO YOU FOR YOUR KIND APPROVAL. 

  

ALSO SIR AS WE ARE COMMITTED TO SUPPLYING YOU MATERIAL ON 90 DAYS TERMS IT 

IS MANDATORY FOR US TO APPLY FOR CREDIT INSURANCE. WE WOULD BE OBLIGED IF 

YOU COULD KINDLY FORWARD TO US DETAILS OF YOUR BANKERS AT THE EARLIEST SO 

THAT WE MAY APPLY TO THEM FOR CREDIT INSURANCE AND OBTAIN THEIR 

CLEARANCE BY THE TIME THE CARGO IS READY FOR DESPATCH. 

  

AWAITINH YOUR VALUABLE FFEDBACK AND ASSURING YOU OF MY BEST SERVICES AT 

ALL TIMES. 

  

THANKS AND REGARDS 

FOR SMARTSTONE 

  

ADITYA 
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Sajor, Zoë

From: Sandra Ramirez <sandra@expostones.com>
Sent: Friday, October 31, 2014 12:10 PM
To: Sajor, Zoë
Subject: FWD: FW: FW: Alleged non-payment of invoices raised on you by your Indian 

Supplier. M/s. Smartstone Pvt Ltd, Bangalore, India
Attachments: Smartstone Inv-Dispute.pdf

This particular email was the last one that he send after speaking with Mr. Said on the matter. He had 
spoken to this same person before. If you look at the attachment on the bottom area, the sales person Mr. 
Aditya wrote down his offer one day that he came into the office. Mr. Said was out so I received him and 
we talked about the material and how it was not what we asked for and he gave us this offer. We turned 
around and gave him the counter-offer of 50% only. He never responded to my email. Then we started 
getting email from the collection agency or Insurance, I honestly don't know who they are. I will be 
emailing you the copy of the Purchase Order that they sent saying it was from us. I will send you that and 
an actual Purchase Order that we have.  
  
Have a Wonderful Day!! 
Sandra Ramirez  
Quality Control Manager 
Expo Granite Marble LLC 
P:713.984.8228 F:713.984.9816 

Skype: expo.stones2012 

MSN Messenger:  
  
  

--------- Original Message ---------  
Subject: FW: FW: Alleged non-payment of invoices raised on you by your Indian Supplier. M/s. 
Smartstone Pvt Ltd, Bangalore, India 
From: "Hari Vinod" <HARI.VINOD@ECGC.IN> 
Date: 7/2/14 1:10 pm 
To: "said@expostones.com" <said@expostones.com> 
Cc: "sandra@expostones.com" <sandra@expostones.com> 
 
Dear Mr. Qartoumy, 
 
Please refer to our tele talks today. 
 
As I understand the gist of our discussions can be put as under: 
 
1. The Expo Stones team did not place the PO SS - 01 dt. 27/12/2011. 
2. Based on tele talks and e-mails, the shipments were made. 
3. The documents were accepted at face value, however the material received was not of the colour 
discussed. 
4. The attachment to this mail which was sent by your office, indicates a negotiation wherein Mr. 
Mittal had offered a discount of 40% an you demanded a discount of 50% since the material was 

sajorz
Rectangle
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not what was called for. 
5. You are still willing to settle for the original terms asked by you i.e., 50% discount. 
 
Please confirm the same and incase any items were missed out, please update the same and confirm 
by return mail. 
 
 
Kind Regards, 
 

(हिर िवनोद) | सहायक महा प्रबंधक| 

(Hari Vinod)| Asst. General Manager 
Chief Resident Representative 
ECGC of India Ltd. | 9,Devonshire Square, London EC2M 4YF 
+44(0) 7448759244 / +44(0) 7404363138 
www.ecgc.in<http://www.ecgc.in/> 
 
________________________________ 
From: Sandra Ramirez [sandra@expostones.com] 
Sent: 02 July 2014 05:49 PM 
To: Hari Vinod 
Subject: RE: FW: Alleged non-payment of invoices raised on you by your Indian Supplier. M/s. 
Smartstone Pvt Ltd, Bangalore, India 
 
Mr. Vinod, 
I have attached the copy of the commercial invoice. If you see in the bottom section is writing by 
Mr. Aditya, he wanted to only give us 40%, Mr. Said counteroffered 50%. After that we didn't hear 
from them. Mr. Said said he would more that gladly pay the 50% if they can agree to that, or we 
can enter into other negotiations? 
 
Have a Wonderful Day!! 
Sandra Ramirez 
Quality Control Manager 
Expo Granite Marble LLC 
P:713.984.8228 F:713.984.9816 
Skype: expo.stones2012 
MSN Messenger: sandraexpostones@hotmail.com<mailto:sandraexpostones@hotmail.com> 
 
 
--------- Original Message --------- 
Subject: FW: Alleged non-payment of invoices raised on you by your Indian Supplier. M/s. 
Smartstone Pvt Ltd, Bangalore, India 
From: "Hari Vinod" <HARI.VINOD@ECGC.IN> 
Date: 7/2/14 6:33 am 
To: "said@expostones.com" <said@expostones.com>, "sandra@expostones.com" 
<sandra@expostones.com> 
Cc: "KOLKATA" <KOLKATA@ECGC.IN>, "Recovery" <Recovery@ecgc.in> 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
IMPORTANT: FAILURE TO RESPOND TO THIS LETTER MAY AFFECT YOUR CREDIT 
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RATING WITH EXPORT CREDIT GUARANTEE CORPORATION OF INDIA LTD. (ECGC) 
 
Sub: Alleged non-payment of invoices raised on you by your Indian Supplier. M/s. Smartstone Pvt 
Ltd, Bangalore, India 
 
Please refer to our earlier communication dt. 19 June 2014. The situation as per our records is that 
the dues on account of shipments from M/s. Smartstone Pvt Ltd, Bangalore, India amounting to 
$22,191.07 as per the details given below were outstanding for long. 
 
Statement of Account: 
 
Sl. No. 
 
Invoice No. 
 
BL No. 
 
Due Date 
 
Invoice Amt. 
 
Paid Amt. 
 
Unpaid Amt. 
 
1 
 
SS 01 DT.27.12.2011 
 
SSPL/8154/2011-12 
 
A712005108 
 
$ 22,191.07 
 
0 
 
$22,191.07 
 
Total 
 
 
 
 
 
$22,191.07 
 
 
To protect ECGC's interests we were constrained to stop further underwriting of risks on your 
account which stops the Corporation from providing insuring shipments made by Indian Exporters 
to your firm. 
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We once again would like to have any further information or clarification from us in this 
connection, please write to us or contact us over telephone. You can also contact over e-mail 
crr.london@ecgc.in & bud@ecgc.in 
 
Once the issues can be cleared and the name of the firm be again approved for cover by the 
Corporation to enable us to cover further shipments by Indian Exporters to you. 
 
If payment is already made, please inform us immediately with proof of payment. 
 
Please treat the matter on a priority basis so that we can bring the matter to an amicable closure. 
 
 
Warm Regards. 
 
 
Kind Regards, 
 

(हिर िवनोद) | सहायक महा प्रबंधक| 

(Hari Vinod)| Asst. General Manager 
Chief Resident Representative 
ECGC of India Ltd. | 9,Devonshire Square, London EC2M 4YF 
+44(0) 7448759244 / +44(0) 7404363138 
www.ecgc.in<http://www.ecgc.in/> 
 
________________________________ 
From: Hari Vinod 
Sent: 19 June 2014 02:11 PM 
To: said@expostones.com; sandra@expostones.com 
Subject: Alleged non-payment of invoices raised on you by your Indian Supplier. M/s. Smartstone 
Pvt Ltd, Bangalore, India 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
IMPORTANT: FAILURE TO RESPOND TO THIS LETTER MAY AFFECT YOUR CREDIT 
RATING WITH EXPORT CREDIT GUARANTEE CORPORATION OF INDIA LTD. (ECGC) 
 
Sub: Alleged non-payment of invoices raised on you by your Indian Supplier. M/s. Smartstone Pvt 
Ltd, Bangalore, India 
 
We are a Government of India export credit insurance organisation extending credit protection to 
Indian exporters on their credit sales to overseas buyers and providing protection to banks 
financing against the security of export bills drawn on overseas buyers. We had insured the 
shipments by the captioned exporter. 
 
It has come to our knowledge that the amount due from you on invoice(s) mentioned below is / are 
overdue and remaining unpaid. This is causing concern to us. Before we can decide on continuing 
to underwrite further credit exposure on you, we would like to ascertain the reason for the alleged 
non payment of the invoices mentioned below and until we could do so, is holding back further 
credit protection to our clients in respect of their supplies to you. 
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Statement of Account: 
 
Sl. No. 
 
PO / Contract / LC no. 
 
Invoice No. 
 
BL No. 
 
Invoice Amt. 
 
Paid Amt. 
 
Unpaid Amt. 
 
1 
 
SS 01 DT.27.12.2011 
 
SSPL/8154/2011-12 
 
A712005108 
 
$ 22,191.07 
 
0 
 
$22,191.07 
 
 
In the event of your failure to pay the amounts due, we may have to de-list you from our approved 
buyers list. Such an action might have an adverse impact on the ability of your Indian suppliers to 
continue to do business with you on credit. 
 
It shall be of immense help to all concerned if you can provide us with the full details of the above 
mentioned invoices that are overdue and remaining unpaid. If there are any specific reasons for 
your non payment, you may please convey to us with supporting documents, if any. 
 
If you would like to have any further information or clarification from us in this connection, please 
write to us or contact us over telephone. You can also contact over e-mail crr.london@ecgc.in & 
bud@ecgc.in 
 
We assure you of our best attention and look forward to hear from you. 
 
 
Kind Regards, 
 

(हिर िवनोद) | सहायक महा प्रबंधक| 
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(Hari Vinod)| Asst. General Manager 
Chief Resident Representative 
ECGC of India Ltd. | 9,Devonshire Square, London EC2M 4YF 
+44(0) 7448759244 / +44(0) 7404363138 
www.ecgc.in<http://www.ecgc.in/> 
 
The information in this mail and any attachment(s) to this message is/are confidential and intended 
solely for the addressee or organisation to whom it is addressed. If you have erroneously received 
this message, please notify mailadmin@ecgc.in immediately and destroy the message and 
attachment(s). If you are not the intended recipient, any copying, forwarding, altering or disclosing 
the contents of this email message may be unlawful. The information, attachment(s) or the opinions 
expressed in this mail are those of the individual sender and not necessarily those of ECGC. ECGC 
accepts no responsibility for any loss or damage arising from the use of this email message or its 
attachment(s). 
 
The information in this mail and any attachment(s) to this message is/are confidential and intended 
solely for the addressee or organisation to whom it is addressed. If you have erroneously received 
this message, please notify mailadmin@ecgc.in immediately and destroy the message and 
attachment(s). If you are not the intended recipient, any copying, forwarding, altering or disclosing 
the contents of this email message may be unlawful. The information, attachment(s) or the opinions 
expressed in this mail are those of the individual sender and not necessarily those of ECGC. ECGC 
accepts no responsibility for any loss or damage arising from the use of this email message or its 
attachment(s). 
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Sajor, Zoë

From: Sandra Ramirez <sandra@expostones.com>
Sent: Friday, October 31, 2014 12:31 PM
To: Sajor, Zoë
Subject: Purchase Order
Attachments: PO#53-Sample.pdf; Smartstone.pdf

One of them is a sample of our Purchase Order and the other is the one that they gave the insurance that we 
supposedly filled out. If you see they look nothing alike.  
  
Have a Wonderful Day!! 
Sandra Ramirez  
Quality Control Manager 
Expo Granite Marble LLC 
P:713.984.8228 F:713.984.9816 

Skype: expo.stones2012 

MSN Messenger:  

sajorz
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Purchase Order
Date

1/16/2014

P.O. No.

53

Vendor

South India Slates

Ship To

Expo Granite Marble LLC
1055 W Sam Houston Pkwy N. Suite 100
Houston, TX 77043

Expo Granite Marble LLC

1055 W Sam Houston Pkwy N. Suite 100
Houston, TX 77043

Total

Item Description Qty Rate Amount

GS-Black Pearl GS-Black Pearl Premium 2cm 2,500 4.39 10,975.00
GS-Absolute Blac... GS-Absolute Black 3cm 1,200 7.10 8,520.00

Proforma Inv. SIS-01-05

$19,495.00
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